110723, 1218 PM EVANS COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION Mail - Fwd: Your PayPal receipt

RSIPT-537)

Stacey Dees <sdees@evanscountyschoaols.org>

= F V823

Amy Rogers <arogers@evanscountyschools.org> Fri, Oct 8, 2023 at 1:43 PM
To: Stacey Dees <sdees@evanscountyschools.org>

Fwd: Your PayPal receipt

1 message

~wu— Forwarded message ———

From: service@paypal.com <service@paypal.com>
Date: Fr, Oct 6, 2023 at 1:35 PM

Subject: Your PayPal receipt

To: Martin G Waters <arogers@evanscountyschools.org>

Hello, Martin G Waters

P

You paid $36.65 USD to Stetson &
Associates Inc.

Create a PayPal account for fast, secure checkouts at millions
of merchants.

Your purchase details \L

Your Transaction ID: Merchant Transaction D

Purchase Date:

October 6, 2023
Payment to; Payment from:
Stetson & Assaciates Inc. Martin G Waters

info@stetsonassociates.com

hitps:fimail. google.com/mailiu/0f ?ik=b417486{20&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f: 177902887 161474087 2% 7 Cmsa-F 177802897 1614740872, 13



10410423, 12:18 PM EVANS COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION Mait - Fwd: Your PayPal racelpt

Invoice ID:
688-7371844

Shipping Address
Martin G Waters

705 West Main Street
Claxton, GA 30417
Linited States

Quantity 1
ftem 50 Instructional Strategies to Build Student Engagament & Participation (print copy)
1D Number

Price $30.00 USD

Subtotal $30.00 USD
Shipping $5.65 USD
Handling fee $1.00USD
Total $36.65 USD

You paid using: Visa

This credit card transaction will appear on your statement as PAYPAL *STETSON.

C

P PayPai

Help & Contact | Security | Apps

PayPal is cammitted to preventing fraudulent emaiis. Emails from PayPal will always contain your full name, Leam to
identify phishing

Plaase don't reply to this email. To get in touch with us, dlick Help & Contacgt.

PayPal Customer Service can be reached at 888-221-1181,

Not sure why you recelved this email? Learn more

Copyright © 1998-2023 PayPal, Inc. All rights reserved, PayPal is located at 2211 M. First St., San Jose, CA 95131,
PayPal RTO00398 en_US(en-US):1.4.0:aec7ac?7b9%

hitps:#/mail. google.com/mailfu/0/7ik=bd17486f204view=pi&search=all&permithid=thread-f; 177902897 161474087 2% 7 Cmsa-F 17790289716 14740872 .. 213



10110123, 12:18 PM EVANS COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION Mail - Fwd: Order #688 Confirmation — Inclusive Schools Network

Stacey Dees <sdees@evanscountyschools.org>

Fwd: Order #688 Confirmation — Inclusive Schools Network
1 message

Amy Rogers <arogers@evanscountyschools.org> Fri, Oct 8, 2023 at 1:42 PM

To: Stacey Dees <sdees@evanscountyschools.org>

~-m FOrwarded message <

From: Inclusive Schools Network <notifications@ecwid.com>
Date: Fri, Oct 8, 2023 at 1:38 PM

Subject: Order #688 Confirmation — |nclusive Schools Network
To: Martin G Waters <arogers@evanscountyschools.org>

INCLUSIVE
SCHOOLS

R

Order Confirmation

Hello Martin G Waters,

We have received your Inclusive Schools Network order! Thank you for your purchase.

Order #688

Payment status Fulfillment status
Paid Awaiting Processing
i (I
" s
. . .._m_,__';'i"j | \ d' \1)
We will deliver your order to N \;\ ‘
Martin G Waters

705 West Main Street, Claxton, Georgia 30417, United States
Phone +1912-739-3544

Shipping method
USPS Ground Advantage™
2-5 days

Your order

hitps:/mail. google. comimailfu/0/?ik=bd 17486/20&view=pl&search=ali&permthid=thread-1779028948406413303%7Cmsa-F 177902689484064 13303, .. 13



10710423, 12:18 PM EVANS COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION Mail - Fwd: Order #6588 Confirmation - inclusive Schools Network

50

50 Instructional Strategies to Build Student Engagement &
Participation (print copy)

SKU: #00022

1 x $30.00

ltems $30.00
Shipping $5.65
Handling fee $1.00
Total $36.65

Payment method
PayPal

Thanks for shopping with us!
You can check the status of your orders at any time on our Qrders History Page.

We welcome you to our store anytime. If you need assistance or have any questions, please
email us at support@inclusiveschools.org or call +1 281-440-4220. We are happy to help!

Sincerely,
Inciusive Schools Network

€ Inclusive Schools Network
Inclusive Schools Netwark, 14343-G Torrey Chase Bivd,, Houston, Texas 77014, United States

This online store is built on Ecwid

hitps:/imail.google com/mailfu/0/7ik=b4 174861208 view=plasearch=ali&permihid=thread-f: 17790289484 064 13303%7Cmsq-1: 17790280484064 13303, 213



10410423, 12:18 PM EVANS COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION Mail - Fwd: Order #6588 Confirmation — Inclusive Schools Network

Amy R. Rogers
Assistant to the Superintendent

&vans County Charter School Syslem
912.739.3544 ext 1223
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