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Attn: MRKETA BROWN, CITY MANAGER
CITY OF GUYTON INVOICE DATE:  JANUARY 6, 2023
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RE: CITY OF GUYTON - GENERAL MATTERS
FEES
HOURS
12/01/2022
WPR
2.20
12/02/2022
BMP
0.30
BMP
0.20
BMP
0.20
WPR WORK ON
2.60
12/05/2022
BMP  CALL REGARDING
REGARDING | I
AND REGARDING 0.20
BmMP RECEIPT AND REVIEW IIEGIGIIEIE
ﬂRESPOND TO 0.40
BMP  EMAILS WITH REGARDING
] 0.10
12/06/2022
BvP  WORKING ON [ £~/ AND CALL
REGARDING [ 0.60
12/07/2022
WPR PHONE CONFERENCE WITH
REGARDING
1.10
R hnmmm—
I 0.30
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HOURS
12/09/2022
MMB PREPARE OR
AND REGARDING 0.30
12/12/2022
BMP  REVIEW
FOR REGARDING
0.50
WPR  REVISION
0.30
12/13/2022
BMP  CALL FROM -REGARDING-
] 0.20
WPR PREPARATION FOR GUYTON CITY COUNCIL
MEETING 0.60
WPR WORK ON
0.90
WPR ATTEND GUYTON CITY COUNCIL MEETING 2.70
WPR TRAVEL TO AND FROM GUYTON CITY COUNCIL
MEETING 1.50
12/14/2022
BMP  MEET WITH ecArDING [ G
0.20
BMP  CALL FROM EGARDING
EMAIL IREGARDING
0.75
BMP  CALL WITH REGARDING G
0.20
12/15/2022
WPR WORK ON
2.80
mMmB  PREPARE I - GARDING
N 0.30
12/18/2022
wper cowvrLeTE NG
.
] 4.40
BMP  WORKING ON
1.90
12/19/2022
svPp  work oN I 1.50
WPR

EMAIL WITH _REGARDING
ND
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WPR REVIEW OF
0.20
MMB PREPARE
0.30
12/20/2022
BMP  EMAILS WITH REGARDING
AND REGARDING
0.20
BMP CALL FROM REGARDING
EGARDING
0.20
12/21/2022
WPR PHONE CONFERENCE WITH
1.30
12/27/2022
svp  work oN [ NI 0.20
12/28/2022
BMP  REVIEW AND COMMENT ON
0.80
WPR REVISE
] 1.20
1212912022
BvP  EMAILS WITH IIllllrecaroine
BEGIN DRAFTING ‘ 0.30
svp  caLL FrRov IR:cARDING GG
] 1020
FOR CURRENT PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 32.35
RECAPITULATION
TIMEKEEPER HOURS RATE
BENJAMIN M. PERKINS 9.15 $275.00
MELISSA M. BOEHLKE 0.90 125.00
WES P. RAHN 22.30 200.00
COSTS

12/29/2022 POSTAGE
TOTAL COSTS

TOTAL CURRENT WORK
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7,088.75

TOTAL
$2,516.25
112.50
4,460.00

0.57
0.57

7,089.32
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BALANCE DUE

PLEASE REMIT
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57.080.32

$7,089.32





