## **OLIVER MANER LLP**

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
218 WEST STATE STREET - POST OFFICE BOX 10186
SAVANNAH, GEORGIA 31412
TELEPHONE (912)236-3311
FAX (912)236-8725

AUGUST 5, 2022

CITY OF GUYTON ATTN: MEKETA BROWN, CITY MANAGER P.O. BOX 99 GUYTON, GA 31312

RE: CITY OF GUYTON - GENERAL MATTERS

INVOICE # 208327

FILE NUMBER: 2899-0005

TAX I.D. # 58-0649326

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PREVIOUS BALANCE

5,758.42

NET PAYMENTS

-5,758.42

BALANCEFORWARD

\$0.00

CURRENT FEES

5,236.25

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES

5,236.25

TOTAL DUE

\$5,236.25

## OLIVER MANER LLP ATTORNEYS AT LAW

## AUGUST 5, 2022 INVOICE# 208327

CITY OF GUYTON

FILE NUMBER: 2899-0005

RE:CITY OF GUYTON - GENERAL MATTERS

PAGE 2

		FEES	HOURS
DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	0.10
07-01-22	BMP	EMAILS WITH MEKETA REGARDING	0.10
07-01-22	BMP	EMAILS WITH MEKETA REGARDING	0.40
-		CALL REGARDING SAME, REGARDING	
07-01-22	BMP	CALL FROM MEKETA AND MARSHAL REGARDING	0.10
07-01-22	BMP	WORKING ON CALL REGARDING EMAIL RELATED TO	0.50
07-01-22	BMP	EMAIL MA YOR REGARDING	0.10
07-01-22	BDG	REVIEWED EMAILS FROM	0.30
07-01-22	BDG	REVIEWED GEORGIA LAW REGARDING	0.40
07-05-22	BMP	WORKING ON EMAIL MEKETA REGARDING	1.00
07-05-22	BDG	REVIEWED TO ANSWER	0.45
07-06-22	ВМР	EMA IL REGA RDINO	0.20
07-08-22	ВМР	CALL WITH	0.40
07-11-22	ВМР	CALL FROM REGARDING	0.20
07-12-22	BMP	PREPARING FOR TONIGHT'S COUNCIL MEETING; REVIEW AGENDA PACKET; CALL MAYOR REGARDING	0.75
07-12-22	BMP	CALL MEKETA AND MS. PELOTE REGARDING REGARDING	0.20
07-12-22	BMP	TRA VEL TO GUYTON, ATTEND COUNCIL MEETING: DURING RIDE HOME, CALL WITH MAYOR REGARDING	3.6
07-13-22	BMP	EMAILS WITH MEKETA REGARDING	0.1
07-13-22	BMP	ANALYSIS REGARDING WALKER REGARDING	0.3
07-13-22	BMP	CALL FROM MR. LEE REGARDING REGARDING	0.4
07-14-22	BMP	CALL FROM BOE ATTORNEY REGARDING	0.1

# OLIVER MANER LLP

### ATTORNEYS AT LAW

AUGUST 5, 2022 INVOICE# 208327

CITY OF GUYTON I.D. 2899-0005 - BMP RE:CITY OF GUYTON - GENERAL MATTERS

1 - 1 - 1

PAGE 3

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	HOURS
		MA YOR AND MEKETA	9
07-14-22	BMP	EMAILS WITH MATTHEW REGARDING	0.10
07-14-22	DG	PULL PAST INVOICES AND EMAIL SAME TO MATTHEW WALKER FOR	0.50
07-15-22	BMP	CALL FROM MR. JOHNSON REGARDING REGARDING	0.30
07-15-22	ВМР	CALL WITH MATTHEW REGARDING	0.20
07-15-22	ВМР	EMAILS WITH MEKETA REGARDING	0.20
07-19-22	BMP	EMAILS WITH MEKETA AND CHARLIE REGARDING	0.20
07-19-22	BMP	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON AGREEMENT; EMAILS REGARDING	0.40
07-20-22	BMP	CALL FROM MAYOR REGARDING	0.1
07-20-22	BMP	RECEIPT AND REVIEW ; DETAILED EMAIL TO WITH MY SUGGESTED REVISIONS; EMAIL MAYOR AND CHIEF REGARDING	1.0
07-20-22	BDG	REVIEWED REGARDING TO ANSWER MEKETA'S QUESTION CALLED MEKETA, LEFT MESSAGE	0.3
07-21-22	BMP	WORKING ON REVIEW DETAILED EMAIL TO	1.6
07-21-22	ВМР	WORKING ON REGARDING	0.0
07-21-22	BDG	RESEARCHED GEORGIA LAW REGARDING; CONFERRED WITH BENJAMIN M. PERKINS REGARDING	0.:
07-25-22	BMP	CALL FROM MEKETA REGARDING	0.3
07-25-22	ВМР	WORKING ON CHECK RECORDS; SUGGEST REVISIONS	1.
07-25-22	BMP	RECEIPT AND REVIEW A GREEMENT REGARDING REGARDING DETAILED EMAIL TO CITY WITH MY COMMENTS	0.
07-26-22	BMP	EMAILS WITH MAYOR REGARDING	0.
07-26-22	BMP	EMAILS WITH MEKETA	0
07-27-22	ВМР	CALL FROM MEKETA REGARDING PROVIDED SUGGESTED RESPONSE	0
07-27-22	ВМР	EMAILS WITH	0
07-28-22	DG	EMAILS TO AND FROM	0

### OLIVER MANER LLP

#### ATTORNEYS AT LAW

AUGUST 5, 2022

CITY OF GUYTON I.D. 2899-0005 - BMP INVOICE# 208327

PAGE 4

RE:CITY OF GUYTON - GENERAL MATTERS

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	HOURS
07-28-22	ВМР	RECEIPT AND REVIEW. MEKETA REGARDING	EMAILS WITH 0.50 RECEIVE AND
	ВМР	REVIEW CALL WITH MR. WALKER REGARDING	0.25
	TOTAL	HOURS	19.90

TIMEKEEPER	HOURS	275.00 200.00 125.00	AMOUNT 4,771.25 390.00 75.00
BENJAMIN M. PERKINS	17.35 1.95 0.60		
BRIAN D. GRIFFIN			
DEBRA GRONDZIAK			
TOTAL HOURS & FEES	19.90		5,236.25
TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES			5,236.25
TOTAL DUE			\$5,236.25

DAVID H. DICKEY I. GREGORY HODGES ROBERT W. SCHIVERA (GA & NC) PATRICK T. O'CONNOR JAMES P. GERARD PATRICIA T. PAUL TIMOTHY D. ROBERTS LEE A. SUMMERFORD ANDREW M. WILKES WILLIAM J. HUNTER BENJAMIN M. PERKINS (GA & FL) PAUL H. THRELKELD JACOB D. MASSEE (GA & CO) GEORGE T. MAJOR, JR. T. LAWRENCE EVANS BRYAN A. SCHIVERA (GA & SC) R. BENJAMIN LINGLE J. RYAN BEASLEY

DAVID B. MULLENS, III



I. WILLIAM DROUGHT, III
BRIAN D. GRIFFIN
WILLIAM C. PHILLIPS
AMELIA C. STEVENS
JOY D. BONNER
VICTORIA R. NEASE

OF COUNSEL WILLIAM P. FRANKLIN, JR. JULIAN R. FRIEDMAN DOUGLAS J. GIORGIO, III

August 5, 2022

City of Guyton Attn: Meketa Brown, City Manager Post Office Box 99 Guyton GA 31312

RE: City of Guyton - General Matters

Dear Meketa:

I enclose with this correspondence invoice number 208327 for the above-referenced matter. The invoice reflects all of the professional services provided by my firm for the designated billing period and the respective costs we have advanced for your case. If this invoice meets your approval, please place it in line for payment. Of course, if you have any questions regarding the substance of the invoice, please do not hesitate to contact me. Thank you once again for the opportunity to provide legal services to the City. We appreciate your business.

Sincerely,

Benjamin M. Perkins

For the Firm

Enclosure

