OLIVER MANER LLP

ATTO RNEYS AT LAW
218 WEST STATE STREET - PO ST O FFICE BO X 10186
SAVANNAH, GEORGIA 31412
TELEPHONE (912)236-3311
FAX (912)236-8725

MAY 4, 2022

CITY OF GUYTON ATTN: WILLIAM SAWYER, CITY MANAGER P.O. BOX 99 GUYTON, GA 31312

RE: CITY OF GUYTON - GENERAL MATTERS

INVOICE # 205790

25,818.28

FILE NUMBER: 2899-0005

TAX I.D. # 58-0649326

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PREVIOUS BALANCE

NET PAYMENTS -25,818.28

BALANCE FORWARD \$0.00

CURRENT FEES 5,798.75

CURRENT DISBURSEMENT 38.99

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES 5,837.74

TOTAL DUE \$5,837.74

OLIVER MANER LLP ATTO RNEYS AT LAW

MAY 4, 2022 INVOICE# 205790

CITY OF GUYTON

PAGE 2

FILE NUMBER: 2899-0005

RE:CITY OF GUYTON - GENERAL MATTERS

1.100.00		TOOLS TO THE REPORT OF THE PARTY OF THE PART	
DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	HOURS
04-04-22	BMP	EMAILS WITH MEKETA REGARDING ORR REGARDING	0.70
04-04-22	ВМР	CALL FROM MEKETA REGARDING WHO ARE ADDITIONAL RESEARCH; CALL DETAILED EMAIL TO MEKETA WITH MY ANALYSIS AND SUGGESTED RESPONSE TO	0.90
04-05-22	BMP	FINALIZE LETTER TO MR. AND MRS. SPRAGUE (WELL ISSUE)	0.20
04-05-22	BMP	EMAILS WITH REGARDING	0.10
04-05-22	DG	EDIT LETTER TO THE SPRAGUES REGARDING WELL; SCAN TO I DRIVE; PRINT TO FILE; MAIL LETTER AND EMAIL SAME TO CITY	0.10
04-07-22	BDG	EDITED SCRIVENER'S AFFIDAVIT; CONFERRED WITH MAYOR REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE WITH WARREN RATCHFORD REGARDING AFFIDAVIT	0.50
04-11-22	BMP	WORK ON SCRIVENERS AFFIDAVIT (EDWARDS)	0.10
04-11-22	BMP	REVIEW ING CORRESPONDENCE FROM MS. SZILAGYI; CALL MS. SZILAGYI	0.40
04-11-22	BMP	CALL MAYOR	0.30
04-11-22	BMP	REVIEW ING CORRESPONDENCE WITH VOGELEYS	0.20
04-11-22	ВМР	CALL FROM MR. SPRAGUE REGARDING WELL; EMAIL REGARDING	0.20
04-11-22	BDG	PHONE CALL WITH COUNCILMAN REISER REGARDING	0.20
04-11-22	BDG	CONFERRED WITH BENJAMIN M. PERKINS REGARDING SCRIVENERS AFFIDAVIT FOR S. CAMELLIA COURT; EMAILS TO WARREN RATCHFORD REGARDING FINALIZED AFFIDAVIT	0.30
04-12-22	ВМР	WORKING ON SPRAGUE WELL ISSUE; CALL AND EMAIL MEKETA REGARDING	0.85
04-12-22	BMP	CALL FROM MR. LEE REGARDING	0.20
04-12-22	BMP	CALL FROM MEKETA REGARDING	0.40
04-12-22	BMP	ANALYSIS REGARDING: PROPOSAL; MEET WITH BRIAN REGARDING SAME	0.50
04-12-22	BMP	ANALYSIS REGARDING CALL MAYOR REGARDING	0.30
04-12-22	BMP	CALL FROM REGARDING 1	0.40
04-12-22	BDG	CONFERRED WITH BENJAMIN M. PERKINS REGARDING FOR CITY COUNCIL MEETING; CONFERRED WITH BENJAMIN M. PERKINS REGARDING	0.90
04-12-22	BDG	CONFERRED WITH BENJAMIN M. PERKINS REGARDING	0.30

OLIVER MANER LLP

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

MAY 4, 2022 INVOICE# 205790

CITY OF GUYTON

I.D. 2899-0005 - BMP

RE:CITY OF GUYTON - GENERAL MATTERS

PAGE 3

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	HOURS
04-12-22	BDG	REVIEWED ALCOHOL ORDINANCE IN PREPARATION FOR CITY COUNCIL MEETING	0.50
04-12-22	BDG	TRA VEL TO AND FROM GUYTON FOR CITY COUNCIL MEETING; ATTENDED CITY COUNCIL MEETING	4.60
04-13-22	ВМР	DEBRIEF WITH BRIAN FOLLOWING LAST NIGHT'S COUNCIL MEETING, PARTICULARLY REGARDING	0.30
04-13-22	ВМР	EMAILS REGARDING CALL MR. REISER REGARDING	0.55
04-13-22	BDG	CONFERRED WITH BENJAMIN M. PERKINS REGARDING CITY COUNCIL MEETING, DISCUSSED	0.30
04-13-22	BDG	REVIEWED H.B. 405, WHICH AMENDS THE ZONING PROCEDURES LAW TO REQUIRE ADDITIONAL DUE PROCESS REQUIREMENTS WHEN LOCAL GOVERNMENTS ARE MAKING ZONING DECISIONS	0.20
04-14-22	BMP	ATTEND CALL WITH	1.00
04-14-22	BDG	PHONE CALL WITH REGARDING	1.00
04-14-22	BDG	PREPARED FOR PHONE CALL WITH	0.60
04-18-22	BMP	CALL FROM MEKETA REGARDING	0.10
04-18-22	BMP	EXECUTE RESOLUTION 2022 -02; FORW ARD TO JENNA	0.10
04-19-22	MMB	CONVERT .PST FILES TO PDF FOR REVIEW AND REDACTION; ASSIST BENJAMIN M. PERKINS WITH REDACTION.	0.80
04-19-22	BMP	REVIEW EMAILS RESPONSIVE TO JESSICA'S OPEN RECORDS REQUEST AND REDACT AS NEEDED; REVIEW OLIVER MANER INVOICES AND REDACT EXEMPT ITEMS; EMAILS REGARDING SAME WITH MEKETA	2.00
04-19-22	BMP	CALL FROM MR. JOHNSON REGARDING	0.30
04-19-22	BMP	EMAIL FROM MEKETA REGARDING. BRIEF RESEARCH REGARDING SAME	0.30
04-19-22	BMP	EMAILS WITH MAYOR REGARDING	0.10
04-19-22	BDG	EDITED ALCOHOL ORDINANCE PER COUNCIL'S AMENDMENT AT APRIL MEETING; EMAIL SAME TO MAYOR	0.10
04-19-22	BDG	RESEARCHED TO DETERMINE	1.00
04-20-22	BMP	BRIEF RESEARCH REGARDING A EMAIL TO	0.25
04-21-22	BDG	REVIEWED CITY CODE TO DETERMINE	1.50

OLIVER MANER LLP

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

MAY 4, 2022 INVOICE# 205790

CITY OF GUYTON

I.D. 2899-0005 - BMP

RE:CITY OF GUYTON - GENERAL MATTERS

PAGE 4

DATE	ATTY	DES CRIPTION OF S ERVICES	HOURS
		CONFERRED WITH BENJAMIN M. PERKINS REGARDING SAME; PHONE CALL WITH REGARDING SAME; EMAIL TO REGARDING	
04-21-22	BMP	EMAILS WITH MEKETA REGARDING	0.10
04-21-22	BMP	QUICK CALL FROM CHIEF REGARDING	0.10
04-21-22	BMP	WORKING ON QUESTION FOR	0.20
04-21-22	BMP	CALL WITH MEKETA AND MAYOR REGARDING, ETC.; CALL MR. JOHNSON REGARDING	0.50
04-25-22	ВМР	CALL FROM A NONYMOUS PERSON REGARDING. COMMITTING WITH HER FORMER EMPLOYER, IRONY OF NAME OF WEBSITE. (NO CHARGE)	0.00
04-26-22	ВМР	RECEIPT AND REVIEW JESSICA'S ORR REGARDING HOURS OF DAY WORKED BY EACH POLICE OFFICER ON A GIVEN DAY; CONFIRM WITH OTHER CITY ATTORNEYS THAT THEY DON'T PROVIDE SUCH INFORMATION SINCE CRIMINALS WILL USE THE INFO TO COMPROMISE SECURITY; EMAIL AND REGARDING	0.30
	TOTAL	HOURS	24.85

TIMEKEEPER	HOURS	RATE/HOUR	AMOUNT
BENJAMIN M. PERKINS	11.95	275.00	3,286.25
BRIAN D. GRIFFIN	12.00	200.00	2,400.00
DEBRA GRONDZIAK	0.10	125.00	12.50
MELISSA M. BOEHLKE	0.80	125.00	100.00
TOTAL HOURS & FEES	24.85		5,798.75

Date	Disbursements Description		
	POSTAGE		0.53
04/26/22	FEDERAL EXPRESS		38.46
		Total Disbursements	38.99
	TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES		5,837.74